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Description

Technical Field

[0001] This invention relates to a construction machine
comprising a refueling hose storage assembly and a stor-
age compartment for storing a refueling hose useful upon
supplying fuel to a fuel tank.

Background Art

[0002] As a conventional technology of this sort, there
is one disclosed in Patent Document 1. This conventional
technology is directed to a construction that a fuel tank
is arranged on a revolving upperstructure of a hydraulic
excavator as a construction machine, a storage compart-
ment for storing therein a refueling hose useful upon re-
fueling the fuel tank is arranged adjacent the fuel tank,
and a hose holding structure for holding in the storage
compartment the refueling hose with a portion thereof
being coiled to form a coiled portion is arranged. This
hose holding structure includes a member arranged in
the storage compartment and an upwardly open, square
U- shaped hook fixed on the member. The coiled portion
of the refueling hose can be held on the hook.
Patent Document 1: JP- A- 2003- 328887
[0003] Patent Document 2: US 5082217 discloses a
vehicle having a hydraulic system with hoses and a hose
storage assembly comprising a hose holding structure
for holding the hose with a portion thereof being coiled
to form a coiled portion, the hose holding structure com-
prising an upper restraining part for restraining the coiled
portion at an upper part thereof and a lower part for re-
straining the coiled portion at a lower part thereof. A con-
struction machine according to the preamble of claim 1
is known from JP 2002089391.

Disclosure of the Invention

Means to Be Solved by the Problem

[0004] A conventionally-used refueling hose is formed
in its entirety from rubber and is relatively soft. Even when
after completion of refueling work of the fuel tank, for
example, a portion of the refueling hose is coiled over a
plurality of times to form a coiled portion and the coiled
portion is held on the hook that makes up the hose holding
structure of the above-mentioned conventional technol-
ogy, the refueling hose can, therefore, be stored in the
storage compartment such that the coiled portion re-
mains in a stable form without developing a problem.
[0005] A problem, however, arises if one tries to store
in such a storage compartment a refueling hose which
has been being developed in recent years and contains
a mixed reinforcing material. Described specifically, a re-
fueling hose with a mixed reinforcing material mixed
therein as mentioned above has higher stiffness and larg-
er resilience compared with one simply making use of

rubber as a material. Therefore, an attempt to coil a por-
tion of the refueling hose to form a coiled portion and to
hold the coiled portion on the above-mentioned hook
making up the hose holding structure according to the
conventional technology may lead to a potential problem
that by the resilience of the coiled portion, the coiled por-
tion may bounce back to become unstable or may bounce
out from the storage compartment. For such a potential
problem, it has conventionally been desired to develop
a storage assembly that can store in a storage compart-
ment a coiled portion of a refueling hose while allowing
it to retain its stable form even when the refueling hose
contains a mixed reinforcing material.
[0006] With the above-mentioned circumstances of the
conventional technology in view, the present invention
has as an object thereof the provision of a refueling hose
storage assembly that can store in a storage compart-
ment a coiled portion of a refueling hose without allowing
its coiled portion to bounce back or bounce out even when
the refueling hose contains a mixed reinforcing material.

Means for Solving the Problem

[0007] To achieve the above-described object, a con-
struction machine according to the present invention
comprises a construction machine comprising a fuel tank,
a refuelinghose, and a refueling hose storage assembly
disposed in the construction machine, said refueling hose
storage assembly having a storage compartment for stor-
ing therein the refueling hose to be used upon refueling
the fuel tank and a hose holding structure for holding the
refueling hose with a portion thereof being coiled to form
a coiled portion, wherein: the hose holding structure is
arranged in the storage compartment, and includes a
bracket having an upper restraining part for restraining
the coiled portion of the refueling hose at an upper part
thereof and a lower restraining part for restraining the
coiled portion at a lower part thereof, wherein: the upper
and lower restraining parts of the bracket each include
first and second restraining means for restraining the
coiled portion of the refueling hose, which has been
stored in the storage compartment, such that the coiled
portion is prevented from bouncing back in thickness di-
rection and radial direction thereof, respectively, where-
in: the storage compartment is arranged adjacent the fuel
tank, and is provided in a side wall thereof with an opening
for enabling carry-in and carry-out of the refueling hose
into and from the storage compartment, the storage as-
sembly is further provided with a cover for opening and
closing the opening of the storage compartment, and the
bracket is fixed in the storage compartment such that the
coiled portion of the refueling hose remains in a form that
the coiled portion is positioned in a direction oblique to
an imaginary plane defined by the cover, wherein: the
storage assembly is further provided with a rear support
arranged as a reinforcing member in the storage com-
partment at a rear position which is on a side of the fuel
tank, a front support arranged as another reinforcing
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member in the storage compartment at a front position,
and another bracket fixed on the rear support, the bracket
includes a plate member having a tilted plate portion fixed
on the another bracket, the refueling hose has a strainer
forming a fuel suction port, and the hose holding structure
includes a strainer holding section, which is fixed on the
front support and can hold the strainer of the refueling
hose.
[0008] According to the present invention constructed
as described above, upon storing the refueling hose in
the storage compartment, for example, after completion
of refueling work of the fuel tank, the portion of the refu-
eling hose is coiled to form the coiled portion, and in this
state, the coiled portion is held at its upper and lower
parts by the upper and lower restraining parts of the
bracket, respectively. The refueling hose can, therefore,
be stored in the storage compartment while maintaining
a stable form without allowing its coiled portion to bounce
back or bounce out even when the refueling hose con-
tains a mixed reinforcing material. Accordingly, the stor-
age work of the refueling hose into the storage compart-
ment is facilitated. It is to be noted that, when it is desired
to take the stored refueling hose out of the storage com-
partment upon refueling the fuel tank, the refuelinghose
can be readily taken out of the storage compartment by
releasing the restraint to the upper and lower parts of the
coiled portion of the refueling hose by the upper and lower
restraining parts of the bracket.
[0009] Further, according to the present invention con-
structed as described above, the coiled portion of the
refueling hose can be restrained by the first restraining
means of the upper restraining part of the bracket and
the first restraining means of the lower restraining part
of the bracket such that the coiled portion is prevented
from bouncing back in the thickness direction, and the
coiled portion of the refueling hose can be restrained by
the second restraining means of the upper restraining
part and the second restraining means of the lower re-
straining part such that the coiled portion is prevented
from bouncing back in its radial direction. The refueling
hose can, therefore, be stored in the storage compart-
ment while surely maintaining a stable form by these re-
straining means without allowing its coiled portion to
bounce back or bounce out even when the refueling hose
contains a mixed reinforcing material and has large re-
silience.
[0010] Further, according to the present invention con-
structed as described above, it is only necessary, upon
storing the refueling hose into the storage compartment,
to open the cover and then to carry the refueling hose
into the storage compartment through its opening such
that the coiled portion of the refueling hose is positioned
in the oblique direction. Therefore, the storage work of
the refueling hose into the storage compartment can be
readily performed. When the storage compartment is
formed, for example, such that it has a substantially rec-
tangular shape as seen in plan, the coiled portion of the
refueling hose can be arranged to extend along a diag-

onal of the rectangular shape. As a consequence, the
shape and dimensions of the storage compartment can
be set relatively small.
[0011] Further, according to the present invention con-
structed as described above, the bracket having the up-
per and lower restraining parts can be firmly fixed on the
rear support as the reinforcing member via the tiltedplate
portion of the plate member of the bracket and the an-
other bracket. As a consequence, the upper and lower
restraining parts of the bracket can be stably maintained
in the direction oblique to the imaginary plane defined by
the cover. When the refueling hose has been stored in
the storage compartment, the strainer of the refueling
hose can be held at the strainer holding section fixed on
the front support. As a consequence, the refueling hose
can be stored in a more stable form in the storage com-
partment.
[0012] The refueling storage assembly according to
the present invention may also be characterized in that
in the above-described invention, the upper and lower
restraining parts of the bracket are arranged on the plate
member of the bracket at portions thereof other than the
tilted plate portion, respectively, the first and second re-
straining means of the upper restraining part form a
downwardly-open, square U-shaped part capable of re-
ceiving therein the upper part of the coiled portion of the
refueling hose, and the first and second restraining
means of the lower restraining part form a ring-shaped
part having a substantially rectangular shape as seen in
plan and capable of receiving therein the lower part of
the coiled portion of the refueling hose.
[0013] Upon storing the refueling hose in the storage
compartment according to the present invention con-
structed as described above, the coiled portion of the
refueling hose can be readily held in the upper and lower
restraining parts of the bracket, for example, by receiving
the lower part of the coiled portion of the refueling hose
in the ring-shaped part having the substantially rectan-
gular shape as seen in plan and formed by the first and
second restraining means of the lower restraining part
and then vertically pressing the coiled portion in this state
to press down the coiled portion and to receive the upper
part of the coiled portion in the upwardly-open, square
U-shaped part. As a consequence, the storage work of
the refueling hose can be efficiently performed. When it
is desired to take the stored refueling hose out of the
storage compartment upon refueling the fuel tank, it is
only necessary, for example, to take out the stored refu-
eling hose in an order reverse to the above-mentioned
order, specifically to vertically press the coiled portion of
the refueling hose to release it from the upper restraining
part of the bracket and then to take the coiled portion out
of the lower restraining part. Therefore, the take-out work
of the refueling hose can be readily performed.

Advantageous Effects of the Invention

[0014] In the present invention, the hose holding struc-
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ture that holds the refueling hose with the portion thereof
being coiled to form the coiled portion is arranged in the
storage compartment, and includes the bracket having
the upper restraining part for restraining the coiled portion
of the refueling hose at the upper part thereof and the
lower restraining part for restraining the coiled portion at
the lower part thereof. After completion of refueling work
of the fuel tank, the refueling hose can, therefore, be
stored in the storage compartment while maintaining a
stable form by the upper and lower restraining parts of
the bracket without allowing its coiled portion to bounce
back or bounce out even when the refueling hose con-
tains a mixed reinforcing material and has great resil-
ience. Accordingly, the storage work of the refueling hose
into the storage compartment is facilitated. As a conse-
quence, it is possible to improve the efficiency of the re-
fueling work of the fuel tank. In a construction machine
which is prone to be subjected to impact force and large
vibrations as a result of various work, the refueling hose
stored in the storage compartment can be maintained in
a stable state during the various work even when the
refueling hose contains a mixed reinforcing material and
has large resilience. It is, therefore, possible to realize a
refueling hose storage assembly of high reliability.

Best Mode for Carrying out the Invention

[0015] A best mode for carrying out the refueling hose
storage assembly according to the present invention will
hereinafter be described with reference to drawings.
[0016] FIGS. 1A and 1B are views illustrating a hydrau-
lic excavator of the small swing radius type cited as an
example of a construction machine in which one embod-
iment of the refueling hose storage assembly according
to the present invention is to be disposed, in which FIG.
1A is a side view and FIG. 1B is a front view.
[0017] The refueling hose storage assembly according
to this embodiment is to be disposed in the construction
machine, for example, the hydraulic excavator of the
small swing radius type as illustrated in FIGS. 1A and
1B. This hydraulic excavator is provided with a travel
base 1, a revolving upperstructure 2 mounted on the trav-
el base 1, and a front working mechanism 3 attached
tiltably in an up-and-down direction to the revolving up-
perstructure 2. The front working mechanism 3 includes
a boom 4, an arm 5, and a bucket 6. On the revolving
upperstructure 2, an operator’s cab 7 is also mounted on
one side of the front working mechanism 3 as illustrated
in FIG. 1B. On an opposite side, a fuel tank 8 and the
refueling hose storage assembly 9 according to this em-
bodiment are disposed as illustrated in FIG. 1A.
[0018] FIG. 2 is a perspective view illustrating essential
parts of the revolving upperstructure of the hydraulic ex-
cavator of the small swing radius type illustrated in FIGS.
1A and 1B, on which the refueling hose storage assembly
according to this embodiment is to be disposed, and FIG.
3 is a perspective view illustrating the essential parts of
FIG. 2 in a state that the cover has been removed. FIG.

4 is a view illustrating a hose holding structure arranged
in the refueling hose storage assembly according to this
embodiment and is a view as observed from the direction
of arrow "A" of FIG. 3, and FIG. 5 is a view illustrating the
hose holding structure arranged in the refueling hose
storage assembly according to this embodiment and is
a view as observed from the direction of arrow "B" of FIG.
3. FIGS. 6A to 6C are views illustrating a rear support
arranged as a reinforcing member in the refueling hose
storage assembly according to this embodiment, in which
FIG. 6A is a front view, FIG. 6B is a plan view, and FIG.
6C is a side view, and FIGS. 7A to 7C are views illustrating
a front support arranged as another reinforcing member
in the refueling hose storage assembly according to this
embodiment, in which FIG. 7A is a front view, FIG. 7B is
a plan view, and FIG. 7C is a side view. FIGS. 8A to 8C
are views illustrating a first bracket making up the hose
holding structure arranged in the refueling hose storage
assembly according to this embodiment, in which FIG.
8A is a front view, FIG. 8B is a plan view, and FIG. 8C is
a side view, FIGS. 9A to 9D are views illustrating a second
bracket making up the hose holding structure arranged
in the refueling hose storage assembly according to this
embodiment, in which FIG. 9A is a front view, FIG. 9B is
a plan view, FIG. 9C is a side view, and FIG. 9D is a rear
view, and FIGS. 10A and 10B are views illustrating a
strainer making up the hose holding structure arranged
in the refueling hose storage assembly according to this
embodiment, in which FIG. 10A is a front view and FIG.
10B is a plan view.
[0019] As illustrated in FIG. 3, the refueling hose stor-
age assembly 9 according to this embodiment is provided
with a storage compartment 13, in which a refueling hose,
specifically a suction hose 11 and a supply hose 12 are
stored. The suction hose 11 sucks up fuel stored in an
unillustrated container such as a drum, while the supply
hose 12 supplies to the fuel tank 8 the fuel sucked up by
the suction hose 11. The suction hose 11 and supply
hose 12 are made, for example, from a rubber material
which contains a reinforcing material and has relatively
strong flexibility and large resilience. This storage com-
partment 13 is arranged, for example, adjacent the fuel
tank 8. Formed in a side wall of the storage compartment
13 is an opening 13A that enables carry-in and carry-out
of the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 into and from
the storage compartment 13. As illustrated in FIG. 2, a
cover 10 for opening and closing the opening 13A is at-
tached over the opening 13A.
[0020] As illustrated in FIGS. 3, 4 and 5, this embodi-
ment is also provided with a hose holding structure, which
is arranged in the storage compartment 13 and holds the
refueling hose, for example, the suction hose 11 with a
portion thereof being coiled to form a coiled portion 11A.
As illustrated in FIG. 5, this hose holding structure in-
cludes a second bracket 18A, which has an upper re-
straining part 18B for restraining an upper part of the
coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 and a lower
restraining part 18C for restraining a lower part of the
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coiled portion 11A.
[0021] The upper restraining part 18B and lower re-
straining part 18C of the second bracket 18A each include
a first restraining means and a second restraining means.
The first restraining means restrains the coiled portion
11A of the suction hose 11, which is stored in the storage
compartment 13, such that the coiledportion 11A is pre-
vented from bouncing back in a direction in which loops
of the hose overlap each other, that is, in a thickness
direction of the hose, while the second restraining means
restrains the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11,
which is stored in the storage compartment 13, such that
the coiled portion 11A is prevented frombouncingback in
a radial direction of the coiled portion. It is to be noted
that as illustrated in FIG. 3, the second bracket 18A is
fixed in the storage compartment 13 to maintain the coiled
portion 11A of the suction hose 11 in a coiled form posi-
tioned in a direction oblique to an imaginary plane defined
by the above-mentioned cover 10.
[0022] This embodiment is also provided with a rear
support 14 arranged as a reinforcing member at a rear
position in the storage compartment 13, said rear position
being on a side of the fuel tank 8, as illustrated in FIGS.
3 and 6A to 6C, a front support 15 arranged as another
reinforcing member at a front position in the storage com-
partment 13 as illustrated in FIGS. 3 and 7A to 7C, and
another bracket fixed on the rear support 14, specifically
a first bracket 17 as illustrated in FIG. 3.
[0023] As illustrated in FIGS. 6A to 6C, the rear support
14 is formed in the shape of letter "L" having an upright
part and a horizontal part arranged in conjunction with
an upper portion of the upright part, and the upright part
is provided with two bolt holes 14A. As illustrated in FIGS.
7A to 7C, the front support 15 is also formed in the shape
of letter "L" having an upright part and a horizontal part
arranged in conjunction with an upper portion of the up-
right part, and the upright part is provided with two bolt
holes 15A.
[0024] As illustrated in FIG. 8B, the first bracket 17 is
formed of a first plate member 17A having, for example,
a shape of letter "W" as viewed in plan and a second
plate member 17B fixed on the first plate member 17A
and having, for example, a shape of letter "L" as viewed
in plan. As illustrated in FIG. 8A, two holes 17A1 are
formed in the first plate member 17A. These two holes
17A1 match with the above-mentioned bolt holes 14A in
the rear support 10. By inserting bolts through these holes
17A1 into threaded engagement with the bolt holes 14A,
the first bracket 17 is fixed on the rear support 14. As
illustrated in FIGS. 8A and 8B, holes 17B2, which com-
municate to two nuts 17B1 and threaded holes of these
nuts 17B1, respectively, are formed in the second plate
member 17B.
[0025] As illustrated in FIGS. 9A to 9D, the second
bracket 18 includes a plate member 18A having a tilted
plate portion 18A1. The upper restraining part 18B is fixed
on the plate member 18A at an upper position other than
the tilted plate portion 18A1, while the lower restraining

part 18C is fixed on the plate member 18A at a lower
position other than the tilted plate portion 18A1. The tilted
plate portion 18A1 is provided with holes 18A1a formed
at positions matching with the nuts 17B1 and holes 17B2,
respectively, which are arranged on and in the above-
mentioned second plate member 17B of the first bracket
17 illustrated in FIGS. 8A to 8C. These nuts 17B1 and
holes 17B2 arranged on and in the first bracket 17 match
with the tilted plate portion 18A1 of the second bracket
18. By inserting bolts through these holes 18A1a and
holes 17B2 into threaded engagement with the nuts
17B1, the tilted portion 18A1 of the second bracket 18B
is fixed on the first bracket 17 as illustrated in FIG. 3.
[0026] As illustrated in FIGS. 9A to 9D, the upper re-
straining part 18B of the second bracket 18 has fixed
portions 18B1 formed of a pair of pipe-shaped members
fixed on the plate member 18A, horizontal portions 18B2
formed of a pair of pipe-shaped members arranged in
conjunction with upper ends of the fixed portions 18B1,
and a U-shaped pendant portion 18B3 which is pendant
from free ends of the horizontal portions 18B2, and is
formed as a downwardly-open, reversed square U-
shapedpart capable of receiving the upper part of the
coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11. The fixed por-
tions 18B1 and pendant portion 18B3 of the upper re-
straining part 18B, said pendant portion 18B3 being lo-
cated opposite the fixed portions 18B1, make up the first
restraining means that restrains the upper part of the
coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 such that the
upper part is prevented from bouncing back in its thick-
ness direction, and the horizontal portions 18B2 of the
upper restraining part 18B make up a second restraining
means that restrains the upper part of the coiled portion
11A of the suction hose 11 such that the upper part is
prevented from bouncing back in the radial direction of
the coiled portion.
[0027] As also illustrated in FIGS. 9A to 9D, the lower
restraining part 18C of the second bracket 18 has a fixed
portion 18C1 fixed on the plate member 18A, a front por-
tion 18C2 arranged opposite the fixed portion 18C1, and
side portions 18C3,18C4 arranged in conjunction with
these fixed portion 18C1 and front portion 18C2, and is
formed as a ring-shaped part which has a substantially
rectangular shape as seen in plan and can receive the
lower part of the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose
11. The fixed portion 18C1 and front portion 18C2 make
up a first restraining means that restrains the lower part
of the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 such that
the lower part is prevented from bouncing back in its thick-
ness direction, and the side portions 18C3, 18C4 make
up a second restraining means that restrains the lower
part of the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 such
that the lower part is prevented from bouncing back in
the radial direction of the coiled portion.
[0028] As illustrated in FIG. 4 described above, one
end of the suction hose 11 is connected to a refueling
pump 21, and to an opposite end of the suction hose 11,
a strainer 19 is attached. This strainer 19 forms a suction
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port upon suction of fuel from a drum or the like in which
the fuel is stored. This strainer 19 is internally provided
with a check valve that prevents a reverse flow toward
the container such as the drum. One end of the supply
hose 12 is connected to the above-mentioned refueling
pump 21. An opposite end of the supply hose 12 serves
as a supply port to the fuel tank 8. The refueling pump
21 can be arranged, for example, within a space formed
in a revolving frame 2A located underneath the fuel tank
8 illustrated in FIG. 3.
[0029] As illustrated in FIGS. 3 and 4, a strainer holding
section 20 that holds the strainer 19 of the suction hose
11 is fixed on the front support 15. This strainer holding
section 20 is also included together with the above-men-
tioned second bracket 18 in the hose holding structure
that holds the suction hose 11. As illustrated in FIGS.
10A and 10B, this strainer holding section 20 is provided
with a cylindrical part 23 and a receiving part 23. Into the
cylindrical part 23, the strainer 19 of the suction hose 11
can be inserted. The receiving part 23 supports the cy-
lindrical part 23, and is fixed on the front support 15. The
receiving part 23 is formed of an upright portion 22A and
a horizontal portion 22A. The upright portion 22A has
holes 22A1 through which bolts are inserted to fix the
receiving part 23 on the front support 15. The horizontal
portion 22A is arranged in conjunction with an upper end
of the upright portion 22A, and carries the cylindrical part
23 fixed thereon. The holes 22A1 in the upright portion
22A of the receiving part 23 match the bolt holes 15A in
the front support 15 illustrated in FIGS. 7A to 7C. By bolts
inserted through the holes 22A1 into engagement with
the bolt holes 15A, the receiving part 23 is fixed on the
front support 15.
[0030] According to this embodiment constructed as
described above, upon storing the refueling hose, that
is, the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 in the storage
compartment 13 after completion of refueling work of the
fuel tank 8, the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11
can be readily held in the upper and lower restraining
parts 18B, 18C of the second bracket 18, for example,
by coiling the portion of the suction hose 11 to form the
coiled portion 11A, carrying these suction hose 11, sup-
ply hose 12 and refueling pump 21 into the storage com-
partment 13 through the opening 13A, receiving, for ex-
ample, the lower part of the coiled portion 11A of the
suction hose 11 in this state in the ring-shaped part hav-
ing the substantially rectangular shape as seen in plan
and formed by the fixed portion 18C1, front portion 18C2
and side portions 18C3, 18C4, in other words, in the lower
restraining part 18C of the second bracket 18, and ver-
tically pressing the coiled portion 11A in this state to re-
ceive it in the reversed square U-shaped part formed by
the fixed portions 18B1, horizontal portions 18B2 and
pendant portion 18B3, in other words, in the upper re-
straining part 18B of the second bracket 18. The strainer
19 attached to the suction hose 11 is inserted into the
cylindrical part 23 of the strainer holding section 20. Fur-
ther, the refueling pump 21 is stored, for example, un-

derneath the fuel tank 8. Subsequently, the opening 13A
of the storage compartment 13 is closed by the cover 10
as illustrated in FIG. 2. In this manner, the storage work
of the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 can be effi-
ciently performed.
[0031] Upon refueling the fuel tank 8, on the other
hand, it is only necessary to open the cover 10 of the
storage compartment 13, to pull the strainer 19, which is
attached to the suction hose 11, out of the cylindrical part
23 of the straining holding section 20, to vertically press
the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 to release
the coiled portion 11A from the upper restraining part 18B
of the second bracket 18, to release the coiled portion
11A from the lower restraining part 18C, to carry out the
suction hose 11, supply hose 12 and refueling pump 21
in this state, for example, through the opening 13A of the
storage compartment 13, to insert the strainer 19, which
is attached to the suction hose 11, into a container such
as a drum containing fuel stored therein, to insert the
opposite end of the supply hose 12 into the fuel tank 8,
and then to drive the refueling pump 21 in this state. As
a result, the fuel stored in the container such as the drum
is guided by the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 and
is supplied into the fuel tank 8. After completion of the
supply of the fuel, the suction hose 11, supply hose 12
and refueling pump 21 are received and stored as men-
tioned above.
[0032] According to this embodiment constructed as
described above, upon storing the suction hose 11, which
makes up the refueling hose, into the storage compart-
ment 13 after completion of refueling work of the fuel tank
8, the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11 can be
stored in the storage compartment 13 while maintaining
a stable form without allowing the coiled portion 11A to
bounce back or bounce out by restraining the coiled por-
tion 11A of the suction hose 11 at the upper and lower
parts thereof by the upper and lower restraining parts
18B,18C of the second bracket 18 as mentioned above
even when the suction hose 11 contains a mixed rein-
forcing material. Accordingly, the storage work of the suc-
tionhose 11 and supply hose 12 into the storage com-
partment 13 is facilitated. As a consequence, it is possible
to improve the efficiency of the refueling work of the fuel
tank 8. In a construction machine which is prone to be
subjected to impact force and large vibrations as a result
of various work, specifically in a hydraulic excavator of
the small swing radius type, the suction hose 11 and sup-
ply hose 12 stored in the storage compartment 13 can
be maintained in a stable state during the various work
even when the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 con-
tain a mixed reinforcing material and have large resil-
ience. It is, therefore, possible to realize a high-reliability
storage assembly for the suction hose 11 and supply
hose 12.
[0033] The coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11
can be restrained by the fixed portions 18B1 and pendant
portion 18B3, which make up the first restraining means
of the upper restraining part 18B of the second bracket
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18, such that the coiled portion 11A is prevented from
bouncing back in the thickness direction, and the coiled
portion 11A of the suction hose 11 can be restrained by
the horizontal portions 18B2 making up the second re-
straining means of the upper restraining part 18 and the
side portions 18C3, 18C4 making up the second restrain-
ing means of the lower restraining part 13C such that the
coiledportion 11A is prevented from bouncing back in the
radial direction. The suction hose 11 can, therefore, be
stored in the storage compartment 13 while surely main-
taining a stable form by these restraining means.
[0034] Upon storing into the storage compartment 13
the suction hose 11 with the portion thereof being coiled
to form the coiled portion 11A, it is only necessary to open
the cover 10 and then to carry the suction hose 11 into
the storage compartment 13 through the opening 13A
such that the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose 11
is positioned in the oblique direction. Therefore, the stor-
age work of the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12 into
the storage compartment 13 can be readily performed.
When the storage compartment 13 is formed, for exam-
ple, such that it has a substantially rectangular shape as
seen in plan, the coiled portion 11A of the suction hose
11 can be arranged to extend along the diagonal of the
rectangular shape. As a consequence, the shape and
dimensions of the storage compartment 13 can be set
relatively small.
[0035] Further, the second bracket 18 having the upper
and lower restraining parts 18B, 18C can be firmly fixed
on the rear support 14 as the reinforcing member via the
tilted plate portion 18A1 of the plate member 18A of the
second bracket 18 and the first bracket 17. As a conse-
quence, the upper and lower restraining parts 18B, 18C
of the second bracket 18 can be stably maintained in the
direction oblique to the imaginary plane defined by the
cover 10. When the suction hose 11 and supply hose 12
have been stored in the storage compartment 13, the
strainer 19 attached to the suction hose 11 can be held
in the strainer holding section 20 fixed on the front support
15. As a consequence, the suction hose 11 canbe stored
in a more stable form in the storage compartment 13.

Brief Description of the Drawings

[0036]

[FIGS. 1A and 1B] FIGS. 1A and 1B are views illus-
trating a hydraulic excavator of the small swing ra-
dius type cited as an example of the construction
machine in which one embodiment of the refueling
hose storage assembly according to the present in-
vention is to be disposed, in which FIG. 1A is a side
view and FIG. 1B is a front view.
[FIG. 2] FIG. 2 is a perspective view illustrating es-
sential parts of the revolving upperstructure of the
hydraulic excavator of the small swing radius type
illustrated in FIGS. 1A and 1B, on which the refueling
hose storage assembly according to this embodi-

ment is to be disposed.
[FIG. 3] FIG. 3 is a perspective view illustrating the
essential parts of FIG. 2 in a state that the cover has
been removed.
[FIG. 4] FIG. 4 is a view illustrating a hose holding
structure arranged in the refueling hose storage as-
sembly according to this embodiment and is a view
as observed from the direction of arrow "A" of FIG. 3.
[FIG. 5] FIG. 5 is a view illustrating the hose holding
structure arranged in the refueling hose storage as-
sembly according to this embodiment and is a view
as observed from the direction of arrow "B" of FIG. 3.
[FIGS. 6A to 6C] FIGS. 6A to 6C are views illustrating
a rear support arranged as a reinforcing member in
the refueling hose storage assembly according to
this embodiment, in which FIG. 6A is a front view,
FIG. 6B is a plan view, and FIG. 6C is a side view.
[FIGS. 7A to 7C] FIGS. 7A to 7C are views illustrating
a front support arranged as another reinforcing mem-
ber in the refueling hose storage assembly according
to this embodiment, in which FIG. 7A is a front view,
FIG. 7B is a plan view, and FIG. 7C is a side view.
[FIGS. 8A to 8C] FIGS. 8A to 8C are views illustrating
a first bracket making up the hose holding structure
arranged in the refueling hose storage assembly ac-
cording to this embodiment, in which FIG. 8A is a
front view, FIG. 8B is a plan view, and FIG. 8C is a
side view.
[FIGS. 9A to 9D] FIGS. 9A to 9D are views illustrating
a second bracket making up the hose holding struc-
ture arranged in the refueling hose storage assembly
according to this embodiment, in which FIG. 9A is a
front view, FIG. 9B is a plan view, FIG. 9C is a side
view, and FIG. 9D is a rear view.
[FIGS. 10A and 10B] FIGS. 10A and 10B are views
illustrating a strainer making up the hose holding
structure arranged in the refueling hose storage as-
sembly according to this embodiment, in which FIG.
10A is a front view and FIG. 10B is a plan view.

Legend

[0037]

2 Revolving upperstructure
2A Revolving frame
8 Fuel tank
9 Refueling hose storage assembly
10 Cover
11 Suction hose (refueling hose)
11A Coiled portion
12 Supply hose (refueling hose)
13 Storage compartment
13A Opening
14 Rear support
15 Front support
16 Hose holding unit
17 First bracket
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17A First plate member
17B Second plate member
18 Second bracket (hose holding structure)
18A Plate member
18A1 Tilted plate portion
18B Upper restraining part
18B1 Fixed portion (first restraining means)
18B2 Horizontal portion (second restraining means)
18B3 Pendant portion (first restraining means)
18C Lower restraining part
18C1 Fixed portion (first restraining means)
18C2 Front portion (first restraining means)
18C3 Side portion (second restraining means)
18C4 Side portion (second restraining means)
19 Strainer
20 Strainer holding section (hose holding struc-

ture)
21 Refueling pump
22 Receiving part
22A Upright portion
22B Horizontal portion
23 Cylindrical part

Claims

1. A construction machine comprising a fuel tank (8),
a refueling hose (11), and a refueling hose storage
assembly (9) disposed in the construction machine,
said refueling hose storage assembly having a stor-
age compartment (13) for storing therein the refu-
eling hose to be used upon refueling the fuel tank
and a hose holding structure (18) for holding the re-
fueling hose (11) with a portion thereof being coiled
to form a coiled portion (11A), wherein:

the hose holding structure (18) is arranged in
the storage compartment (13), and includes a
bracket (18) having an upper restraining part
(18B) for restraining the coiled portion of the re-
fueling hose at an upper part thereof, charac-
terised by a lower restraining part (18C) for re-
straining the coiled portion at a lower part there-
of,
wherein:
the upper and lower restraining parts (18B, 18C)
of the bracket each include first and second re-
straining means for restraining the coiled portion
(11A) of the refueling hose (11), which has been
stored in the storage compartment, such that
the coiled portion is prevented from bouncing
back in thickness direction and radial direction
thereof, respectively,
wherein:
the storage compartment (13) is arranged adja-
cent the fuel tank (8), and is provided in a side
wall thereof with an opening (13A) for enabling
carry-in and carry-out of the refueling hose (11)

into and from the storage compartment,
the storage assembly (9) is further provided with
a cover (10) for opening and closing the opening
of the storage compartment (13), and
the bracket (18) is fixed in the storage compart-
ment such that the coiled portion of the refueling
hose remains in a form that the coiled portion is
positioned in a direction oblique to an imaginary
plane defined by the cover, wherein:

the storage assembly (9) is further provided
with a rear support (14) arranged as a rein-
forcing member in the storage compartment
(13) at a rear position which is on a side of
the fuel tank (8), a front support (15) ar-
ranged as another reinforcing member in
the storage compartment (13) at a front po-
sition, and another bracket (17) fixed on the
rear support (14),
the bracket (18) includes a plate member
(18A) having a tilted plate portion (18A1)
fixed on the another bracket (17),
the refueling hose (11) has a strainer (19)
forming a fuel suction port, and
the hose holding structure (18) includes a
strainer holding section (20), which is fixed
on the front support (15) and can hold the
strainer (19) of the refueling hose (11).

2. The construction machine according to claim 1,
wherein:

the upper and lower restraining parts (18B, 18C)
of the bracket are arranged on the plate member
of the bracket at portions thereof other than the
tilted plate portion, respectively,
the first and second restraining means (18B1,
18B3; 18B2) of the upper restraining part (18B)
form a downwardly-open, square U-shaped part
capable of receiving therein the upper part of
the coiled portion (11A) of the refueling hose,
and
the first and second restraining means (18C1,
18C2; 18C3, 18C4) of the lower restraining part
form a ring-shaped part having a substantially
rectangular shape as seen in plan and capable
of receiving therein the lower part of the coiled
portion (11A) of the refueling hose.

Patentansprüche

1. Baumaschine, umfassend einen Kraftstofftank (8),
einen Betankungsschlauch (11) und eine Betan-
kungsschlauch-Stauanordnung (9), die in der Bau-
maschine angeordnet ist, wobei die Betankungs-
schlauch-Stauanordnung ein Staufach (13) zum
Verstauen des beim Betanken des Kraftstofftanks

13 14 
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zu verwendenden Betankungsschlauchs darin und
eine Schlauchhaltestruktur (18) zum Halten des Be-
tankungsschlauchs (11) aufweist, wobei ein Teil da-
von aufgewickelt ist, um einen aufgewickelten Teil
(11A) zu bilden, wobei:

die Schlauchhaltestruktur (18) in dem Staufach
(13) angeordnet ist und einen Bügel (18) auf-
weist, der einen oberen Festhalteteil (18B) zum
Festhalten des aufgewickelten Teils des Betan-
kungsschlauchs an dessen oberem Teil hat, ge-
kennzeichnet durch einen unteren Festhalte-
teil (18C) zum Festhalten des aufgewickelten
Teils an dessen unterem Teil,
wobei:

die oberen und die unteren Festhalteteile
(18B, 18C) des Bügels jeweils erste und
zweite Festhaltemittel zum Festhalten des
aufgewickelten Teils (11A) des in dem Stau-
fach verstauten Betankungsschlauchs (11)
aufweisen, so dass der aufgewickelte Teil
daran gehindert wird, in dessen Dickenrich-
tung bzw. dessen radialer Richtung zurück-
zuspringen,

wobei:

das Staufach (13) neben dem Kraftstofftank
(8) angeordnet ist und in dessen Seiten-
wand mit einer Öffnung (13A) vorgesehen
ist, um ein Einlegen und Ausziehen des Be-
tankungsschlauchs (11) in das Staufach
und aus ihm heraus zu ermöglichen,
die Stauanordnung (9) ferner mit einer Ab-
deckung (10) zum Öffnen und Schließen
der Öffnung des Staufachs (13) ausgestat-
tet ist, und
der Bügel (18) so in dem Staufach fixiert ist,
dass der aufgewickelte Teil des Betan-
kungsschlauchs so in einer Form bleibt,
dass der aufgewickelte Teil in einer Rich-
tung schräg zu einer von der Abdeckung
definierten gedachten Ebene angeordnet
ist, wobei:

die Stauanordnung (9) ferner mit einer
hinteren Stütze (14), die als ein Verstär-
kungselement in dem Staufach (13) an
einer hinteren Position angeordnet ist,
die auf einer Seite des Kraftstofftanks
(8) ist, einer vorderen Stütze (15), die
als ein weiteres Verstärkungselement
in dem Staufach (13) an einer vorderen
Position angeordnet ist, und einem wei-
teren Bügel (17), der an der hinteren
Stütze (14) fixiert ist, ausgestattet ist,
der Bügel (18) ein Plattenelement

(18A) mit einem angewinkelten Plat-
tenteil (18A1) einschließt, der an dem
weiteren Bügel (17) fixiert ist,
der Betankungsschlauch (11) einen
Saugkopf (19) hat, der einen Kraft-
stoffansauganschluss bildet, und
die Schlauchhaltestruktur (18) einen
Saugkopfhalteabschnitt (20) aufweist,
der an der vorderen Stütze (15) fixiert
ist und den Saugkopf (19) des Betan-
kungsschlauchs (11) halten kann.

2. Baumaschine gemäß Anspruch 1, wobei:

die oberen und die unteren Festhalteteile (18B,
18C) des Bügels auf dem Plattenelement des
Bügels jeweils an Teilen davon angeordnet sind,
die nicht der angewinkelte Plattenteil sind,
die ersten und die zweiten Festhaltemittel
(18B1, 18B3; 18B2) des oberen Festhalteteils
(18B) ein nach unten offenes, rechtwinklig U-
förmiges Teil bilden, das dazu fähig ist, in sich
den oberen Teil des aufgewickelten Teils (11A)
des Betankungsschlauchs aufzunehmen, und
die ersten und die zweiten Festhaltemittel
(18C1, 18C2; 18C3, 18C4) des unteren Fest-
halteteils ein ringförmiges Teil bilden, das eine
in Draufsicht im Wesentlichen rechteckig Form
hat und dazu fähig ist, in sich den unteren Teil
des aufgewickelten Teils (11A) des Betan-
kungsschlauchs aufzunehmen.

Revendications

1. Engin de chantier comprenant un réservoir de car-
burant (8), un tuyau de ravitaillement (11) et un en-
semble de stockage de tuyau de ravitaillement (9)
placés dans l’engin de chantier, ledit ensemble de
stockage de tuyau de ravitaillement comportant un
compartiment de stockage (13) destiné à recevoir le
tuyau de ravitaillement devant être utilisé lors du
remplissage du réservoir de carburant et une struc-
ture de maintien de tuyau (18) pour tenir le tuyau de
ravitaillement (11) avec une partie de celui-ci enrou-
lée pour former une partie enroulée (11A), dans
lequel :

la structure de maintien de tuyau (18) est placée
dans le compartiment de stockage (13), et com-
prend un support (18) comportant une partie de
retenue supérieure (18B) pour maintenir la par-
tie enroulée du tuyau de ravitaillement au niveau
d’une partie supérieure de celle-ci, caractérisé
par une partie de retenue inférieure (18C) pour
maintenir la partie enroulée au niveau d’une par-
tie inférieure de celle-ci,
dans lequel :
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les parties de retenue supérieure et infé-
rieure (18B, 18C) du support comprennent
chacune des premier et deuxième moyens
de retenue pour retenir la partie enroulée
(11A) du tuyau de ravitaillement (11), qui a
été stockée dans le compartiment de stoc-
kage, de telle manière que la partie enrou-
lée est empêchée de rebondir respective-
ment dans la direction de l’épaisseur et
dans la direction radiale de celle-ci,

dans lequel :

le compartiment de stockage (13) est en po-
sition adjacente au réservoir de carburant
(8), et est pourvu, dans une de ses parois
latérales, d’une ouverture (13A) pour per-
mettre l’introduction et l’extraction du tuyau
de ravitaillement (11) dans et du comparti-
ment de stockage,
l’ensemble de stockage (9) est en outre
pourvu d’un capot (10) pour ouvrir et fermer
l’ouverture du compartiment de stockage
(13), et
le support (18) est fixé dans le compartiment
de stockage de telle manière que la partie
enroulée du tuyau de ravitaillement conser-
ve une forme dans laquelle la partie enrou-
lée est positionnée dans une direction obli-
que par rapport à un plan imaginaire défini
par le capot, dans lequel :

l’ensemble de stockage (9) est en outre
pourvu d’un support arrière (14) agen-
cé en tant qu’élément de renforcement
dans le compartiment de stockage (13)
en une position arrière qui est sur un
côté du réservoir de carburant (8), un
support avant (15) agencé en tant
qu’autre élément de renforcement
dans le compartiment de stockage (13)
en une position avant, et un autre sup-
port (17) fixé sur le support arrière (14),
le support (18) comprend un élément
plat (18A) comportant une partie plate
inclinée (18A1) fixée sur l’autre support
(17),
le tuyau de ravitaillement (11) comporte
une crépine (19) formant un orifice
d’aspiration de carburant, et
la structure de maintien de tuyau (18)
comprend une section de maintien de
crépine (20), qui est fixée sur le support
avant (15) et qui peut retenir la crépine
(19) du tuyau de ravitaillement (11).

2. Engin de chantier selon la revendication 1, dans
lequel :

les parties de retenue supérieure et inférieure
(18B, 18C) du support sont disposées sur l’élé-
ment plat du support respectivement en des par-
ties de celui-ci autres que la partie plate inclinée,
les premier et deuxième moyens de retenue
(18B1, 18B3 ; 18B2) de la partie de retenue su-
périeure (18B) forment une partie en U carré
ouverte vers le bas, apte à recevoir la partie su-
périeure de la partie enroulée (11A) du tuyau de
ravitaillement, et
les premier et deuxième moyens de retenue
(18C1, 18C2 ; 18C3, 18C4) de la partie de re-
tenue inférieure forment une partie de forme an-
nulaire de forme substantiellement rectangulai-
re vue en plan et apte à recevoir la partie infé-
rieure de la partie enroulée (11A) du tuyau de
ravitaillement.
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