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(54) CONTROL METHOD FOR CLOTHES PROCESSING DEVICE

(57) Disclosed is a control method of a laundry treat-
ment apparatus. The laundry treatment apparatus in-
cludes a first laundry treatment device (2), a second laun-
dry treatment device (3), a drying and filtering device (6)
and a flushing water passage (4) for flushing the drying
and filtering device (6). The control method includes that
the laundry treatment apparatus, according to operating
states of the two laundry treatment devices (2, 3), controls

the flushing water passage (4) to flush the drying and
filtering device (6). The laundry treatment apparatus is
configured to match the operating states of the two laun-
dry treatment devices (2, 3) to select time suitable for
flushing the drying and filtering device, thereby achieving
the purposes of facilitating drainage of flushing water,
saving time and energy and improving the flushing and
laundry drying effects.
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Description

TECHNICAL FIELD

[0001] The present application relates to the technical
field of laundry washing and drying apparatus, in partic-
ular to a control method of a laundry treatment apparatus.

BACKGROUND

[0002] Serving as a household appliance, a washing
machine gradually becomes an indispensable part in the
life of people. With the improvement of the living stand-
ard, the daily needs of people cannot be met by quick
laundry washing, and sometimes, people need to wear
the clothes in the shortest time after the clothes are
washed, so that a laundry dryer serving as a laundry dry-
ing apparatus increasingly involves in people’s homes.
[0003] However, if a washing machine and a laundry
dryer are placed at home, not only a large space is oc-
cupied, but also people need to transfer laundry washed
by the washing machine into the laundry dryer. Due to
the fact that the capacity of the laundry dryer is generally
smaller than that of the washing machine, the laundry
washed at a time cannot be treated in the laundry dryer
at one time and need to be treated twice or even multiple
times respectively. In addition, there is a roller washing
machine with a drying function at present, but the capac-
ity of the washing machine is generally limited due to the
fact that the roll washing machine needs to conduct dry-
ing, and the whole laundry washing and drying process
lasts for a long time.
[0004] As the prior art, Chinese utility model patent with
the application number of 201220157731.3 filed on April
16, 2012 and entitled a combined type laundry washing
and drying machine, discloses a washing machine in-
cluding a main frame, wherein a washing machine is in-
stalled in a lower frame of the main frame, a laundry dryer
is installed in an upper frame of the main frame. An upper
portion of the washing machine is connected with an elec-
tric appliance control panel through a second isolation
layer. An upper portion of the electric appliance control
panel is connected with the laundry dryer through a first
isolation layer. A washing machine working door is ar-
ranged on the washing machine, and a laundry dryer
working door is arranged on the laundry dryer. According
to the combined type laundry washing and drying ma-
chine, the well-known washing machine and laundry dry-
er are combined together to be manufactured, manufac-
turing materials can be saved, the manufacturing cost
can be reduced. Due to combined manufacturing, the
occupied ground space is small in a using process, and
due to the fact that the laundry dryer forms the working
height on the upper portion, the use is convenient.
[0005] According to the above utility model patent, the
laundry dryer and the washing machine are combined,
so that the problems of washing and drying laundry at
the same time are solved, but the washing machine and

the laundry dryer are not integrated due to different work-
ing processes of the washing machine and the laundry
dryer, resulting in waste of the resources of the washing
machine and the laundry dryer.
[0006] For example, according to a washing and drying
machine with two laundry treatment devices, the two
laundry treatment devices share the same one drying
and filtering device. After drying work, thread scraps and
sundries adhere to the drying and filtering device, thereby
affecting the circulation of drying air. After one laundry
treatment device dries laundry, a large amount of thread
scraps adhere to the drying and filtering device. If the
other laundry treatment device starts to work again at the
moment, the thread scraps on the drying and filtering
device hinder the circulation of drying air, thereby being
adverse to improving the drying effect.
[0007] In view of this, on the basis of the washing and
drying machine, the problem of flushing the drying and
filtering device is solved according to the working fea-
tures of the washing machine/laundry dryer and the laun-
dry dryer.

SUMMARY

[0008] In order to solve the above problems, a first ob-
jective of the present application is to provide a control
method of a laundry treatment apparatus, and particu-
larly, the following technical solution is adopted.
[0009] A control method of a laundry treatment appa-
ratus is provided. The laundry treatment apparatus in-
cludes a first laundry treatment device, a second laundry
treatment device, a drying and filtering device and a flush-
ing water passage for flushing the drying and filtering
device. The control method includes that the laundry
treatment apparatus, controls the flushing water passage
to flush the drying and filtering device according to oper-
ating states of the two laundry treatment devices.
[0010] In the above solution, the two laundry treatment
devices are arranged, and the laundry treatment appa-
ratus is configured to match the operating states of the
two laundry treatment devices to select time suitable for
flushing the drying and filtering device, thereby achieving
the purposes of facilitating drainage of flushing water,
saving time and energy and improving the flushing and
laundry drying effects.
[0011] In one embodiment, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus includes an inflow water passage and a drainage
water passage, the flushing water passage is communi-
cated with the inflow water passage, and the drying and
filtering device is communicated with the drainage water
passage through a connecting pipe. The laundry treat-
ment apparatus controls the flushing water passage to
be conductive to flush the drying and filtering device when
the second/first laundry treatment device drains water,
after being detected that the first/second laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the second/first
laundry treatment device conducts a laundry washing
process.
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[0012] In the above embodiments, the flushing water
passage of the laundry treatment apparatus is directly
connected with the inflow water passage of the laundry
treatment apparatus, and the drying and filtering device
of the laundry treatment apparatus is directly connected
with the drainage water passage. When the other laundry
treatment device is in a laundry washing state, it is de-
termined that a washing time point is in a drainage stage;
and when the operation of the laundry washing process
of the laundry treatment device is in the drainage stage,
the laundry treatment apparatus controls the flushing wa-
ter passage to be conductive to flush the drying and fil-
tering device. Water after flushing can be drained togeth-
er with drained water of the laundry treatment devices
conducting the laundry washing process.
[0013] In one embodiment, the laundry washing proc-
ess includes a plurality of drainage stages. The laundry
treatment apparatus selects a target drainage stage from
the drainage stages. When the laundry washing process
enters the target drainage stage, the drying and filtering
device is controlled to be flushed.
[0014] In the above solution, a laundry washing proc-
ess may include multiple times of drainage stages, for
example, drainage after washing and drainage after rins-
ing. In order to complete the laundry drying process as
soon as possible, the laundry treatment apparatus can
select the latest drainage stage according to the current
stage of the laundry washing process and time sequence
information of the laundry washing process, and controls
the drying and filtering device to be flushed in the drain-
age stage. Of course, the laundry treatment apparatus
may also control the drying and filtering device to be
flushed when the other laundry treatment device is in the
last time of drainage after washing process is complete.
[0015] Further, after one laundry treatment device fin-
ishes laundry drying, the laundry treatment apparatus is
detected that the other laundry treatment device con-
ducts the laundry washing process. The number of sub-
sequent remaining drainage stages in the laundry wash-
ing process is judged according to the current stage of
the laundry washing process, and the target drainage
stage is selected from the drainage stages.
[0016] In one embodiment, when one laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying, the laundry treat-
ment apparatus is detected that the other laundry treat-
ment device conducts a laundry treatment process in-
cluding laundry washing and laundry drying. The drying
and filtering device is controlled to be flushed in the laun-
dry washing process of the laundry treatment process.
[0017] In the above solution, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus preferably flushes the drying and filtering device
in the laundry washing process of the laundry treatment
process, so that when the laundry drying process of the
laundry treatment process is in operation, the drying and
filtering device has been flushed, thereby improving the
laundry drying effect.
[0018] Besides, if it is detected that the laundry drying
process of the laundry treatment process is in operation,

the laundry treatment apparatus conducts the flushing of
the drying and filtering device when the operation of the
laundry drying process is finished. Thereby when laundry
drying is conducted next time, the drying and filtering
device is clean and the laundry drying efficiency is high.
[0019] In one embodiment, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus is detected that the first laundry treatment device
finishes laundry drying and the second laundry treatment
device conducts the drying process; or the second laun-
dry treatment device finishes laundry drying and the first
laundry treatment device conducts the drying process.
The drying and filtering device is controlled to be flushed
when the drying process is finished.
[0020] In the above solution, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus conducts the flushing of the drying and filtering
device after the other laundry treatment device finishes
the operation of the drying process. The drying and fil-
tering device is only flushed once during twice the laundry
drying processes. The drying and filtering device is clean
when laundry drying is conducted next time, and the laun-
dry drying efficiency is high.
[0021] Alternatively, the laundry treatment apparatus
controls the drying process to be suspended, and the
drying and filtering device is flushed.
[0022] In the above solution, when the laundry drying
process of one laundry treatment device is finished, the
drying and filtering device is directly controlled to be
flushed, and then the other laundry treatment device is
controlled to conduct the laundry drying process. The
drying and filtering effects of the laundry treatment device
conducting the laundry drying process later are keeping
good.
[0023] In one embodiment, when the two laundry treat-
ment devices both conduct the drying process, the two
laundry treatment devices operate alternately. The laun-
dry treatment apparatus controls the drying and filtering
device to be flushed when switching the operating laun-
dry treatment device.
[0024] In the above solution, when the two laundry
treatment devices both conduct the drying process, the
laundry treatment apparatus controls the two laundry
treatment devices to operate alternately. The drying ef-
fect of each laundry treatment device is good. When the
operating laundry treatment device is switched, the dry-
ing and filtering device is flushed; thereby the drying ef-
fect of the switched laundry treatment device is good.
[0025] In one embodiment, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus includes a drying fan, and in the process of flush-
ing the drying and filtering device, the laundry treatment
apparatus controls the drying fan to suspend working.
[0026] In the above solution, when the laundry treat-
ment devices being in operation are switched, the drying
and filtering device is flushed. If the drying fan keeps
working, flushing water can be blown into a drying air
duct by the drying fan to be adverse to drying laundry.
Therefore, the drying fan is controlled to suspend working
to prevent the influence on the drying process.
[0027] In one embodiment, when both conducting the

3 4 



EP 3 971 336 A1

5

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

drying process, the two laundry treatment devices oper-
ate alternately. When a laundry treatment barrel of the
first/second laundry treatment device suspends/finishes
rotation, the laundry treatment barrel of the second/first
laundry treatment device starts rotation, the drying fan
suspends working, and the laundry treatment apparatus
controls the drying and filtering device to be flushed.
When flushing the drying and filtering device is finished,
the laundry treatment apparatus controls the drying fan
to work.
[0028] In the above solution, after the laundry treat-
ment device is switched, the laundry treatment barrel of
the switched laundry treatment device rotates, but the
drying fan does not operate. At the moment, the drying
and filtering device is flushed. After flushing the drying
and filtering device is completed, the drying fan is con-
trolled to operate. In the process, although the switched
laundry treatment barrel is not dried immediately, a shak-
ing process is conducted firstly to make the laundry fluffy,
and the drying effect can be improved when the drying
fan is in operation.
[0029] In one embodiment, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus is detected that the first laundry treatment device
finishes laundry drying and the second laundry treatment
device is in a standby state, or the second laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the first laundry
treatment device is in a standby state. In this time the
drying and filtering device is directly controlled to be
flushed.
[0030] In the above solution, when one laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the other laundry
treatment device does not work, the flushing water pas-
sage can be directly controlled to be conductive to flush
the drying and filtering device.
[0031] In one embodiment, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus includes the first laundry treatment device and
the second laundry treatment device which are sequen-
tially arranged from top to bottom. The second laundry
treatment device is connected with the drainage water
passage, and a drainage control device is arranged on
the drainage water passage. The drying and filtering de-
vice is connected with the drainage water passage
through a connecting pipe and located at the upstream
or downstream of the drainage control device.
[0032] In one embodiment, the drainage control device
is a drainage valve. The connecting pipe is connected
with the drainage water passage and located at the up-
stream of the drainage valve. When the drying and filter-
ing device is flushed, the laundry treatment apparatus
controls the drainage valve to be switched on. Alterna-
tively the connecting pipe is connected with the drainage
water passage and located at the downstream of the
drainage valve. When the first laundry treatment device
finishes laundry drying, the laundry treatment apparatus
directly controls the drying and filtering device to be
flushed.
[0033] In one embodiment, the drainage control device
is a drainage pump. The connecting pipe is connected

with the drainage water passage and located at the up-
stream or downstream of the drainage pump. When fin-
ishing the flushing of the drying and filtering device, the
laundry treatment apparatus controls the drainage pump
to be started.
[0034] In the present invention, the laundry treatment
apparatus includes the first laundry treatment device, the
second laundry treatment device, the drying and filtering
device and the flushing water passage for flushing the
drying and filtering device. The control method includes:
controlling the flushing water passage to flush the drying
and filtering device by the laundry treatment apparatus,
according to the operating states of the two laundry treat-
ment devices. In the present invention, the two laundry
treatment devices are arranged. The laundry treatment
apparatus is configured to match the operating states of
the two laundry treatment devices to select the time suit-
able for flushing the drying and filtering device, thereby
achieving the purposes of facilitating drainage of flushing
water, saving time and energy and improving the flushing
and laundry drying effects.

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS

[0035]

Figure 1 is a schematic structural diagram of a laun-
dry treatment apparatus; and
Figure 2 is a control step chart of the laundry treat-
ment apparatus.

[0036] 1, housing; 2, first laundry treatment device; 3,
second laundry treatment device; 4, flushing water pas-
sage; 5, drainage water passage; 6, drying and filtering
device; 7, connecting pipe; 8, drainage control device;
and 9, water inlet valve.

DETAILED DESCRIPTION

[0037] In order to make the purpose, the technical so-
lution and the advantages of embodiments of the present
invention clearer, the technical solutions in the embodi-
ments are clearly and completely described in combina-
tion with accompanying drawings in the embodiments of
the present invention. The following embodiments are
used for illustrating the embodiments of the present in-
vention, but are not used for limiting the scope of the
embodiments of the present invention.
[0038] In the description of the present invention, the
orientation or position relation indicated by terms "upper",
"lower", "inner", "outer" and the like is based on the ori-
entation or position relation shown in the accompanying
drawings, and is only used for conveniently describing
the present invention and simplifying the description, in-
stead of indicating or implying that the indicated device
or element has a specific orientation and is constructed
and operated in the specific orientation, so that the terms
cannot be understood as the limitation on the present
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invention.
[0039] In the description of the present invention, it
should be noted that the terms "installation" and "con-
nection" should be interpreted in a broad sense unless
otherwise clearly defined and restricted. For example,
the connection may be a fixed connection, a detachable
connection, or an integrated connection; may be a me-
chanical connection or an electric connection; and may
be a direct connection, and an indirect connection
through an intermediate medium. For those of ordinary
skill in the art, the specific meanings of the above terms
in the present invention can be understood in specific
situations.
[0040] The present invention provides a control meth-
od of a laundry treatment apparatus. As shown in Figure
1, the laundry treatment apparatus includes:

a housing 1;
a first laundry treatment device 2 and a second laun-
dry treatment device 3 arranged in the housing 1.

[0041] Each of the first laundry treatment device 2 and
the second laundry treatment device 3 includes a laundry
treatment barrel. The first laundry treatment device 2 and
the second laundry treatment device 3 may both be used
for drying laundry. Or one of the two laundry treatment
devices is used for drying laundry, the other one is used
for washing laundry. Alternatively one of the two laundry
treatment devices is used for drying laundry, and the oth-
er one is used for washing and drying laundry. Or each
of the two laundry treatment devices is used for washing
and drying laundry.
[0042] The two laundry treatment devices share a dry-
ing and filtering device 6 for filtering drying air.
[0043] The laundry treatment apparatus further in-
cludes a flushing water passage 4, an inflow water pas-
sage and a public drainage water passage 5. One end
of the flushing water passage 4 is connected with the
inflow water passage, the other end of the flushing water
passage 4 is communicated to the drying and filtering
device 6, and a flushing control device (on-off valve) is
arranged on the flushing water passage 4. The inflow
water passage includes a water inlet valve 9 and a water
inlet pipe, one end of the water inlet pipe is connected
with the water inlet valve 9, and the other end of the water
inlet pipe is externally connected with a faucet. The flush-
ing water passage 4 is connected with the water inlet
valve 9 or the water inlet pipe.
[0044] In a connecting structure, the water inlet pipe is
connected with a three-way pipe, the three-way pipe is
communicated with the water inlet valve 9 and the flush-
ing water passage 4 respectively, in this way, the flushing
water passage 4 is communicated with an external water
source through the water inlet pipe. The flushing water
passage 4 can be realized to be blocked and connective
by controlling the on and off of the flushing control device
(for example, the on-off valve) on the flushing water pas-
sage 4.

[0045] The drying and filtering device 6 is connected
to the drainage water passage 5 through a connecting
pipe 7. At least one of the two laundry treatment devices
can be used for washing, and the laundry treatment de-
vice capable of being used for washing is connected with
the drainage water passage 5. As shown in Figure 1, a
U-shaped pipeline is arranged on the connecting pipe 7,
and a siphon structure is formed by the U-shaped pipe-
line, which is conducive to completely draining flushing
water.
[0046] The control method of the present invention in-
cludes that the laundry treatment apparatus, according
to operating states of the two laundry treatment devices,
controls the flushing water passage to flush the drying
and filtering device.
[0047] Preferably, when one laundry treatment device
finishes laundry drying, the laundry treatment apparatus
detects the operating state of the other laundry treatment
device. A time point, at which the flushing water passage
4 is controlled to flush the drying and filtering device 6,
is determined according to the operating state. The two
laundry treatment devices are arranged. When the drying
and filtering device 6 needs to be flushed after one laun-
dry treatment device finishes laundry drying, the laundry
treatment apparatus selects time suitable for flushing the
drying and filtering device on the basis of the operating
state of the other laundry treatment device, thereby
achieving the purposes of facilitating drainage of flushing
water, saving and energy and improving the flushing and
laundry drying effects.

Embodiment I

[0048] In the embodiment, when the laundry treatment
apparatus is detected that the first/second laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the second/first
laundry treatment device conducts a laundry washing
process, the flushing water passage is controlled to be
conductive to flush the drying and filtering device 6 when
the second/first laundry treatment device is a process of
draining water. The flushing water passage 4 of the laun-
dry treatment apparatus is directly connected with the
inflow water passage of the laundry treatment apparatus,
and the drying and filtering device 6 of the laundry treat-
ment apparatus is directly connected with the drainage
water passage 5. When the other laundry treatment de-
vice is in a laundry washing process, it is determined that
the washing time point is in a drainage stage. The laundry
treatment apparatus controls the flushing water passage
4 to be conductive to flush the drying and filtering device
6 when the laundry washing process of the other laundry
treatment device is in the drainage stage. Water after
flushing the drying and filtering device can be drained
along with water used in the laundry washing process of
the other laundry treatment device.
[0049] Specifically, the laundry washing process in-
cludes a plurality of drainage stages. The laundry treat-
ment apparatus selects a target drainage stage from the

7 8 



EP 3 971 336 A1

7

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

drainage stages. When the laundry washing process is
in the target drainage stage, the drying and filtering de-
vice 6 is controlled to be flushed.
[0050] It should be noted that generally, laundry wash-
ing process may include multiple times of drainage, for
example, drainage after washing and drainage after rins-
ing. In one laundry washing process, there are more than
one time of drainage for washing and drainage for rinsing.
In order to complete the laundry drying process as soon
as possible, the laundry treatment apparatus can select
the latest drainage stage according to the current stage
of the laundry washing process and time sequence in-
formation of the laundry washing process, and control
the drying and filtering device 6 to be flushed in the latest
drainage stage. Of course, the laundry treatment appa-
ratus may also control the drying and filtering device 6
to be flushed when the other laundry treatment device
finishes the last time of drainage for washing. The drain-
age water passage is provided with a drainage valve,
and the drying and filtering device 6 may be connected
to the drainage water passage through the connecting
pipe 7 and located at the upstream or downstream of the
drainage valve. When the connecting pipe 7 is connected
to the drainage water passage and located at the up-
stream of the drainage valve, the above technical solution
needs to be adopted. That is, when the drainage valve
is switched on in the drainage stage, the drying and fil-
tering device needs to be controlled to be flushed.
[0051] Besides, when the connecting pipe 7 is con-
nected to the drainage water passage and located at the
downstream position of the drainage valve, the control
method can also be as follows. When one laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the laundry treat-
ment apparatus is detected that the other laundry treat-
ment device conducts the laundry washing process, the
flushing water passage 4 is directly controlled to be con-
ductive to flush the drying and filtering device 6. The dry-
ing and filtering device 6 is connected to the drainage
water passage 5 through the connecting pipe 7 and lo-
cated at the downstream of the drainage valve. In this
way, part of the flushing water to be drained may be re-
mained in the drainage water passage 5. So, when the
drying and filtering device 6 is flushed in the drainage
stage, the flushing water containing a large amount of
thread scraps can flow out of the laundry treatment ap-
paratus along with the drained water during washing.

Embodiment II

[0052] In the embodiment II, the laundry treatment de-
vices can conduct a laundry treatment process including
laundry washing and laundry drying. When one laundry
treatment device finishes laundry drying and the laundry
treatment apparatus is detected that the other laundry
treatment device conducts the laundry treatment process
including laundry washing and laundry drying, the drying
and filtering device 6 is controlled to be flushed in the
laundry washing process of the laundry treatment proc-

ess.
[0053] The laundry treatment apparatus preferably
flushes the drying and filtering device 6 in the laundry
washing process of the laundry treatment process. So,
when the laundry drying process of the laundry treatment
process is in operation, the drying and filtering device 6
has been flushed, thereby improving the laundry drying
effect.
[0054] In addition, there is a situation that when one
laundry treatment device finishes laundry drying and the
laundry treatment apparatus is detected that the laundry
drying process of the other laundry treatment process is
in operation, the laundry treatment apparatus conducts
the flushing of the drying and filtering device 6 after the
operation of the laundry drying process is finished. So,
when laundry drying is conducted next time, the clean
drying and filtering device 6 and the laundry drying effi-
ciency are ensured.

Embodiment III

[0055] In the embodiment III, when the laundry treat-
ment apparatus is detected that the first/second laundry
treatment device finishes laundry drying and the sec-
ond/first laundry treatment device conducts the drying
process, the drying and filtering device 6 is controlled to
be flushed when the drying process is finished. In the
solution, the laundry treatment apparatus conducts the
flushing of the drying and filtering device 6 after the other
laundry treatment device finishes the operation of the
drying process. Thus the drying and filtering device 6 is
only flushed once during two times of laundry drying. The
drying and filtering device has been cleaned by flushing
and thus the laundry drying efficiency is ensured when
laundry drying is conducted next time.
[0056] Alternatively, it also may be that when the laun-
dry treatment apparatus is detected that the first/second
laundry treatment device finishes laundry drying and the
second/first laundry treatment device conducts the dry-
ing process, the laundry treatment apparatus controls
the drying process to be suspended and the drying and
filtering device 6 is flushed firstly. After the drying and
filtering device 6 is flushed, the laundry treatment device
is controlled to continue conducting the drying process.
In the solution, when the laundry drying process of one
laundry treatment device is finished, the drying and fil-
tering device 6 is directly controlled to be flushed, and
then the other laundry treatment device is controlled to
conduct the laundry drying process. Thereby the drying
and filtering effects of the laundry treatment device con-
ducting the laundry drying process later are ensured.

Embodiment IV

[0057] In the embodiment IV, the two laundry treatment
devices both conduct the drying process, the two laundry
treatment devices operate alternately the drying process.
The laundry treatment apparatus controls the drying and
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filtering device 6 to be flushed when switching the oper-
ation of the laundry treatment device.
[0058] In the above solution, when the two laundry
treatment devices both conduct the drying process, the
laundry treatment apparatus controls the two laundry
treatment devices to operate alternately the drying proc-
ess. The drying effect of each laundry treatment device
is ensured. When the operation of the laundry treatment
device is switched, the drying and filtering device 6 is
flushed, and thus the drying effect of the switched laundry
treatment device is ensured.
[0059] The laundry treatment apparatus can conduct-
ing flushing of the drying and filtering device 6 once when
the two laundry treatment devices are switched to work
every time. Thus the drying effect of the switched laundry
treatment device is ensured. Alternatively the laundry
treatment apparatus can control the drying and filtering
device 6 to be flushed once every N times of switching
to work for two treatment devices, so that the drying ef-
ficiency of the whole apparatus is ensured.
[0060] The laundry treatment apparatus includes a
drying air duct, and a drying fan arranged in the drying
air duct. The laundry treatment apparatus controls the
drying fan to suspend working in the process of flushing
the drying and filtering device 6. In the solution, when the
laundry treatment device being working is switched, the
drying and filtering device is flushed. If the drying fan
keeps working, flushing water can be blown into the dry-
ing air duct by the drying fan, which is adverse to drying
laundry. Therefore the drying fan is controlled to suspend
working to prevent the influence on the drying process.
[0061] Preferably, when the two laundry treatment de-
vices both conduct the drying process, the two laundry
treatment devices operate alternately the drying process.
When a laundry treatment barrel of the first/second laun-
dry treatment device suspends or finishes rotation, the
laundry treatment barrel of the second/first laundry treat-
ment device starts rotation. The drying fan suspends
working, and the laundry treatment apparatus controls
the drying and filtering device 6 to be flushed. When flush-
ing the drying and filtering device is finished, the laundry
treatment apparatus controls the drying fan to work. In
the solution, after the laundry treatment device is
switched, the laundry treatment barrel of the switched
laundry treatment device rotates, but the drying fan does
not operate. At the moment, the drying and filtering device
6 is flushed. After flushing the drying and filtering device
is completed, the drying fan is controlled to operate. In
the process, although the laundry treatment barrel to be
switched is not dried immediately, a shaking process is
conducted firstly to make the laundry fluffy. And the drying
effect can be improved when the drying fan is in opera-
tion.

Embodiments V

[0062] In the embodiment V, when one laundry treat-
ment device finishes laundry drying and the laundry treat-

ment apparatus is detected that the other laundry treat-
ment device is in a standby state, the flushing water pas-
sage 4 is directly controlled to be conductive to flush the
drying and filtering device 6. The flushing water is drained
through the drainage water passage 5. In the solution,
when one laundry treatment device finishes laundry dry-
ing and the other laundry treatment device does not work,
the flushing water passage 4 can be directly controlled
to be conductive to flush the drying and filtering device 6.

Embodiment VI

[0063] In the embodiment VI, the laundry treatment ap-
paratus includes the first laundry treatment device 2 and
the second laundry treatment device 3 which are sequen-
tially arranged from top to bottom. The first laundry treat-
ment device 2 is used for drying laundry, the second laun-
dry treatment device 3 can be used for drying and wash-
ing laundry, and the second laundry treatment device 3
is connected with the drainage water passage 5. A drain-
age control device 8 is arranged on the drainage water
passage 5, and the drying and filtering device 6 is con-
nected to the drainage water passage 5 through the con-
necting pipe 7 and located at the upstream or down-
stream of the drainage control device 8.
[0064] In one embodiment, the drainage control device
8 is a drainage valve. When the connecting pipe 7 is
connected to the drainage water passage 5 and located
at the upstream of the drainage valve, the laundry treat-
ment apparatus needs to control the drainage valve to
be switched on to drain water in flushing the drying and
filtering device 6. In the process of flushing the drying
and filtering device 6, the drainage valve can be switched
on to drain washing water and flushing water when the
second laundry treatment device 3 is in the drainage
process. However, when the connecting pipe 7 is con-
nected to the drainage water passage 5 and located at
the downstream of the drainage valve, the drying and
filtering device 6 is controlled to be flushed and it is un-
necessary the second laundry treatment device 3 is in
the drainage process.
[0065] In another embodiment, the drainage control
device 8 is a drainage pump. The connecting pipe 7 is
connected to the drainage water passage 5 and located
at the upstream or downstream of the drainage pump.
When flushing the drying and filtering device 6 is finished,
the laundry treatment apparatus controls the drainage
pump to be started. In the solution, when the drainage
control device 8 is the drainage pump, the principle of
upward drainage is generally adopted. So the drainage
pump needs to be started to pump out flushing water for
flushing the drying and filtering device 6 by the laundry
treatment apparatus. A drainage valve is further arranged
on the drainage water passage 5 and located at the up-
stream of the drainage pump, thus preventing flushing
water from backward flowing.
[0066] As shown in Figure 2, a preferable control step
is provided by combining the solutions of the embodi-
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ments:

S1, finishing laundry drying of one laundry treatment
device;
S2, the laundry treatment apparatus being detected
the operating state of the other laundry treatment
device,
entering S3 if the other laundry treatment device is
in the laundry washing process,
entering S4 if the other laundry treatment device is
in the laundry drying process, and
entering S5 if the other laundry treatment device is
in the standby state;
S3, the laundry treatment apparatus controlling the
drying and filtering device 6 to be flushed in the drain-
age stage, and entering S6;
S4, the laundry treatment apparatus controlling the
drying and filtering device 6 to be flushed when the
laundry drying process is finished, and entering S6;
S5, the laundry treatment apparatus directly control-
ling the drying and filtering device 6 to be flushed,
and entering S6; and
S6, ending control.

[0067] The above descriptions are only preferred em-
bodiments of the present invention, but are not aimed at
limiting the present invention in any forms. Although the
present invention is disclosed above by the preferred em-
bodiments, the preferred embodiments are not aimed at
limiting the present invention. Those skilled in the art can
make some changes by using the above suggestive tech-
nical contents or modify the technical contents as equiv-
alent embodiments of equivalent changes without de-
parting from the scope of the technical solution of the
present invention. Any simple alterations, equivalent
changes and modifications that are made to the above
embodiments according to the technical essence of the
present invention without departing from the contents of
the technical solution of the present invention should all
fall within the scope of the solution of the present inven-
tion.

Claims

1. A control method for a laundry treatment apparatus,
wherein the laundry treatment apparatus comprises
a first laundry treatment device, a second laundry
treatment device, a drying and filtering device and a
flushing water passage for flushing the drying and
filtering device, and
the control method comprises: controlling the flush-
ing water passage to flush the drying and filtering
device according to operating states of the first laun-
dry treatment device and the second laundry treat-
ment device by the laundry treatment apparatus.

2. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-

ratus according to claim 1, wherein the laundry treat-
ment apparatus comprises an inflow water passage
and a drainage water passage, the flushing water
passage is communicated with the inflow water pas-
sage, and the drying and filtering device is commu-
nicated with the drainage water passage through a
connecting pipe; and
the laundry treatment apparatus is detected that the
first/second laundry treatment device finishes laun-
dry drying and the second/first laundry treatment de-
vice conducts a laundry washing process, and then
the flushing water passage is controlled to be con-
ductive to flush the drying and filtering device when
the second/first laundry treatment device is in drain-
age process.

3. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to claim 2, wherein the laundry wash-
ing process comprises a plurality of drainage stages,
the laundry treatment apparatus selects a target
drainage stage from the drainage stages, and
when the laundry washing process enters the target
drainage stage, the drying and filtering device is con-
trolled to be flushed.

4. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to any one of claims 1-3, wherein
the laundry treatment apparatus is detected that the
first/second laundry treatment device finishes laun-
dry drying and the second/first laundry treatment de-
vice conducts a drying process, and then
the drying and filtering device is controlled to be
flushed when the drying process is finished, or, the
laundry treatment apparatus controls the drying
process to be suspended and the drying and filtering
device is flushed.

5. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to any one of claims 1-3, wherein
when both the first laundry treatment device and the
second laundry treatment device conduct the drying
process, the first laundry treatment device and the
second laundry treatment device operate alternately
the drying process, and
the laundry treatment apparatus controls the drying
and filtering device to be flushed when switching be-
tween the operations of the first laundry treatment
device and the second laundry treatment device.

6. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to the claim 5, wherein the laundry
treatment apparatus comprises a drying fan,
the drying fan is controlled by the laundry treatment
apparatus to suspend working in a process of flush-
ing the drying and filtering device.

7. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to claim 6, wherein, during the alter-
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native operation of the first laundry treatment device
and the second laundry treatment device,

when a laundry treatment barrel of the first/sec-
ond laundry treatment device suspends or fin-
ishes rotation and the laundry treatment barrel
of the second/first laundry treatment device
starts rotation, the drying fan suspends working,
the laundry treatment apparatus controls the
drying and filtering device to be flushed, and
controls the drying fan to work when flushing the
drying and filtering device is finished.

8. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to any one of claims 1-3, wherein
the laundry treatment apparatus is detected that the
first/second laundry treatment device finishes laun-
dry drying and the second/first laundry treatment de-
vice is in a standby state, and then the drying and
filtering device is directly controlled to be flushed.

9. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to any one of claims 1-3, wherein
the first laundry treatment device and the second
laundry treatment device are arranged from top to
bottom,

the second laundry treatment device is connect-
ed with the drainage water passage, a drainage
control device is arranged on the drainage water
passage,
the drying and filtering device is connected with
the drainage water passage through the con-
necting pipe and located at the upstream or
downstream of the drainage control device; and
preferably, the drainage control device is a
drainage valve, the connecting pipe is connect-
ed with the drainage water passage and located
at the upstream of the drainage valve, and the
laundry treatment apparatus controls the drain-
age valve to be switched on when the drying and
filtering device is flushed,; or
the connecting pipe is connected with the drain-
age water passage and located at the down-
stream of the drainage valve, and the laundry
treatment apparatus directly controls the drying
and filtering device to be flushed when the first
laundry treatment device finishes laundry dry-
ing.

10. The control method for the laundry treatment appa-
ratus according to claim 9, wherein the drainage con-
trol device is a drainage pump, the connecting pipe
is connected with the drainage water passage and
located at the upstream or downstream of the drain-
age pump, and the laundry treatment apparatus con-
trols the drainage pump to be started when flushing
the drying and filtering device is finished.
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